
LICENSINGACT 2003
Application has been made by Darwin &
Wallace Limited to the Licensing Authority
of London Borough of Lambeth to vary the
Premises Licence for No 32,The Old Town,
32 The Pavement, London, SW4 0JE. The
application is to amend a condition to permit
the sale and consumption of alcohol on the
first floor front terrace until 2300 each day
throughout the year. Full details of the
Application can be viewed at the offices of
the Licensing Authority at London Borough
of Lambeth, 3rd Floor, Civic Centre,
6 Brixton Hill, London, SW2 1EG or via the
website: www.lambeth.gov.uk/licensing. A
responsible authority or any other person
can make written representations to the
Licensing Authority at any time up to and
including 28th November 2024.
It is an offence for anyone knowingly or
recklessly to make a false statement in
connection with a Licence Application. The
maximum fine on summary conviction is
unlimited.
John Gaunt & Partners, Solicitors


